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Bxcept for Special Purpose District vouchers wﬂny%&mm in the above
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doces approve for payment thosé vouchers included in ths abeve .
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Vouchers not approved

' Late Fee page 8: Roads
Invoice # 36097869238
tate Fee $0.35

TDSTELECOM: Based on our research the previous
fl

at 8:37 am, at which time the warrants were given to the Fiscal

Late Fee page 13; Roads

Invoice # 3609785879
Late Feée $2.81

TDSTELECOM: Based on our research the previous payment was submitted io the Auditor's,office
finalized on 8/21/2015 and the pay list was submitted to the Commissio

net’s offi
at 8:37 am, at which time the warrants were given to the Fiseal to be mailed. Tl

Please see the attached document for additional information from Fiscal,

payment was submitted to the Auditor's offlce on 8/17/2015 as part of the regular CAMS run. The batch was
nallzed on 8/21/2015 and the paylist was submitted to the Com

missioner’s office that afternoon. The signed paylist was raceived back in our office on 8/24/2015
to be mailed, The due date of tha statement was 08/27/2015,
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on 8/17/2015 as part of the regular CAMS run. The batch was

ce that afternoon. The signed paylist was recelved back In our office on 8/24/2015
he due date of the statement was 08/27/2015,




Gladis Mendexz

From: Janelle Lindsey

Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2015 9:30 AM

To: Gladis Mendez; Debble Nygaard; Carma Qaksmith

Ce: ’ Suzette Smith; Amanda Migliaccio; Grace Jimenez; Renee Shepherd; Kayla Reynolds
Subject: RE: TDS Telecom Late Fee Docurnentation Request

I apcloglze. The checks were printed 8/21/15 and were mailed out by Fiscal 8/24/15.

Janelle Lindsey "
Accounts Payable

Lewis County Fiscal Services

351 NW North St

Chehalls, WA 98532

360-740-2755
Janelle.Lindsey@lewiscountywa.gov

gg‘% Please consldar the anvironment baforg printing this email

From: Gladis Mendez

Sent: Monday, September 28, 2015 4;51 PM
To: Janelle Lindsey <Janelle.Lindsey@lewiscountywa.gov>; Debbie Nygaard <Debbie. Nygaard@lewlscountywa gOV>;
Carma Qaksmith <Carma.Oaksmith@lewiscountywa,gov>

Cc: Suzette Smith <Suzette.Smith@lewiscountywa.gov>; Amanda Migliaccio <Amanda.Migliaccio @lewiscountywa.govs;
Grace Jimenez <GraceJimenez@lewiscountywa.gov>; Renee Shepherd <Renee.Shepherd @lewiscountywa.gov>; Kayla
Reynolds <Kayla.Reynaolds@lewiscountywa.gove

Subject: FW: TDS Telecom Late Fee Documentation Request ;

Hi Janelie,

Jwould like to include the Information that you gave me in response 10 the Commissioners late fees guestion, but it
appears the date the warrants were mailed out is incorrect. It looks like the confusion Is due to the Finance Systam
“check date”, which is actually the date the hatch is finalized and the paylist is sent to the Commissioners. The warrants
would not be released to be mailed until we received the signed paylist, We received the signed pay list back August
24, 2015 at 8:37 am (See attached pay listing for date stamp). Could you please review your Information and send a
response with the correct information so it can be included in response to the Commissioners? If you have any
guestions, please let me know, Thanks, Gladls

From: Janelle Lindsey

Sent: Monday, September 28, 2015 4:22 PM
To: Gladis Mendez

Cc: Carma Oaksmith

Subject: TDS Telecom Late Fee Documentation Request

Hi Gladis,
Attached are the two August TDS Telecom involces you requested, See below for Fiscal’s timeline:

1




BEPOFRER7Y: Involce dated 8/7/15, rec’d by PW B/6/15, rec’d by Flscal 8/12/15, Input Inte CAMS 8/14/15,
submitted to Auditor's Offfce 8/17/15, check printed and malled out 8/21/15.

3609786988 Invoice dated 8/7/15, rec'd by PW 8/6/15, rec’d by Fiscal 8/10/15, input Into CAMS 8/14/15,
submitted to Auditor's Offfce 8/17/15, check printed and malled out 8/21/15.

Thank you and have a nice evenlngl @

Janelle Lindsey

Accounts Payable

Lewis County Fiscal Services

351 NW North St

Chehalls, WA 98532

360-740-2755 _
danelle.Lindsey@iewiscountywa.pov -

5',% Please considar the epvironment Gefora printing this email




DATE 09/30/2015. . Lewis County, Washington -¥2K- PAGE 93
TIME 15:32:03 PAYMENT APPROVAL LISTING PAYLIST
PAYMENTS TQ BE PROCESSED 0L/01/1875 THRU ¢$/30/2015

PAY # <VOUCHER VENDOR ACCOUNT INVOICE INV DATE PAYMENT Umm.OWHMHHOZ AMOUNT CHK

Vouchers audited and certified by the auditing officer as reguried by RCW
42.24.080, and those expense reimbursement claims cextified as reguired by
ROW 42,24.090, have been recorded on a listing which includes claims of the
County and Specizl Purpose Districts. = -

Except for Speceial Purpose District wouchers inciluded in the above list,
as of this date, 09/30/2015, the Board by a majority vote
does approve for payment thosé vouchers included in the above list,

County Funds Total: S413,444.72
Special Districts Total: 5,00 )
Grand Total: 5413, 444,72
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